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PICNIC AT HANGING ROCK
BOOK TESTIMONIAL
Welcome  to  our  literary  world!  Right
here  at  our  magazine,  we  understand
the power of a good Picnic At Hanging
Rock testimonial.  It  can lead you to
your  next  preferred  book,  widen  your
horizons  with  a  non-fiction  work  of  art,
and  help  you  uncover  brand-new
authors.  That's  why we're delighted to
take you on a journey to check out the
remarkable world of Picnic At Hanging
Rock publication assesses.

DISCOVER NEW BOOKS
As ravenous  viewers,  we all  recognize
the sensation of ending up a book and
questioning  what  to  review  following.
This is where Picnic At Hanging Rock can
be found in convenient. By checking out
evaluations,  we  can  uncover  our
following  preferred  novel  or  non-fiction
masterpiece.

INCREASING YOUR HORIZONS

Perhaps  you  have  actually  never  ever
check  out  a  science  fiction  story
previously,  or  you're  curious  regarding
the  current  self-help  book.  Picnic  At
Hanging Rock can aid you discover new
genres  and  topics,  increasing  your
analysis  perspectives.
When  searching  for  trusted  evaluation
resources,  consider  trusted  publication
blog  sites,  book  testimonial  websites,
and literary magazines. Do not hesitate
to  read  evaluations  from  numerous

sources  to  ge t  a  we l l - rounded
understanding  of  a  publication.

SELECTING THE RIGHT PICNIC AT
HANGING ROCK BOOK

When  choosing  a  new  publication  to
read, it is necessary to choose one that
lines  up  with  your  interests.  Reading
reviews can aid you establish if a Picnic
At Hanging Rock publication is best for
you.  Try to find testimonials  that  review
the  story,  creating  style,  and  general
tone of the book.
And bear in mind, reading is subjective.
Even if a book has glowing reviews does
not  indicate you will  enjoy it,  and the
other way around. Use assesses as an
overview, but inevitably trust your own
impulses when picking your next read.

THE SIGNIFICANCE OF
PICNIC AT HANGING ROCK
REVIEWS
When it  concerns  the  world  of  books,
there's  no  rejecting  the  importance  of
testimonials. Actually, reviews can make
or  break  a  publication's  success.  As
readers, we rely on evaluations to help
us make a decision whether to invest our
time and money in a new publication. As
authors,  reviews  supply  important
comments and can aid boost book sales.
Reviews  likewise  play  a  significant
function  fit  the  literary  globe.  They  can
influence  viewers  viewpoints  and  even
affect the overall understanding of Picnic
At  Hanging  Rock  book  or  writer.
Favorable reviews can produce buzz and
draw  in  brand-new  readers,  while
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adverse  reviews  can  discourage
prospective  visitors  and  hurt  a  book's
online reputation.
As a result, it's necessary to share your
straightforward point of views via Picnic
At  Hanging  Rock  testimonials.  Your
comments  can  help  various  other
readers  locate  their  following  favorite
book  and  assistance  authors  in  their
literary trip. So, the next time you finish
a  publication,  take  a  few  minutes  to
write an evaluation and make your voice
listened to in the world of literary works!

FICTION PICNIC AT HANGING
ROCK TESTIMONIALS
When  i t  perta ins  to  publ icat ion
testimonials, fiction books are frequently
one  of  the  most  commonly  discussed
and  reviewed.  From  romance  and
mystery  to  sci-fi  and  dream,  there  are
numerous styles to select from. Whether
you're  a  follower  of  heartwarming
romance, awesome murder mysteries, or
psychedelic  sci-fi  adventures,  there's
always  Picnic  At  Hanging  Rock  book
waiting to mesmerize you.
Amazon.com:  Picnic  at  Hanging
Rock  (The  Criterion  ...  Picnic  At
Hanging RockPicnic at Hanging Rock will
plunge  viewers  into  the  mysterious
disappearances of three schoolgirls and
one  teacher  on  Valentine's  Day  1900,
taking the audience on a new journey
into the revered Australian novel.Picnic
at Hanging Rock (TV Mini-Series 2018) -
IMDbMemorable  Reboots  and  Remakes
Get ready for " Picnic at Hanging Rock "
starring Natalie Dormer with a look back
at  some classic  movies  and TV shows
that  have  been  rebooted  and  remade
over  the  years.  Won  1  BAFTA  Film
A w a r d .  A n o t h e r  3  w i n s  &  1 1
nominations.Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock
(1975) - IMDbPicnic at Hanging Rock is

based on the timeless Australian novel
by  Joan  Lindsay  and  starring  Natalie
Dormer, with all six episodes of the mini-
series  available  to  stream on May 25,
2018.Watch  Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  -
Season 1 | Prime VideoPicnic at Hanging
Rock is a 1975 Australian mystery drama
film which was produced by Hal and Jim
McElroy,  directed  by  Peter  Weir,  and
starred Rachel Roberts, Dominic Guard,
Helen  Morse,  Vivean  Gray  and  Jacki
Weaver.Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (film)  -
WikipediaPeter  Weir's  beautiful  1975
mystery "Picnic  at  Hanging Rock"  is  a
majestic tour-de-force like nothing else
Weir would ever make in the future. At
the center  of  the story  is  the strange
...Picnic at Hanging Rock (1975) - Rotten
TomatoesPicnic  at  Hanging Rock is  an
Australian  mystery  romantic  drama
television  series  that  premiered  on
Foxtel 's Showcase on 6 May 2018. The
series was adapted from Joan Lindsay 's
1967 novel of the same name about a
group  of  schoolgirls  who,  while  on  an
outing  to  Hanging  Rock,  mysteriously
disappear.Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (TV
series) - WikipediaSet in 1900, Picnic at
Hanging  Rock  tells  the  story  of  three
Australian  boarding  school  girls  who
inexplicably  vanish  on  a  field  trip  to  a
remote  and  historic  landmark,  the
Hanging  Rock.  While  the...The  end  of
Amazon's  'Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock'
explainedPicnic  at  Hanging  Rock  is  an
Australian historical fiction novel by Joan
Lindsay. Set in 1900, it is about a group
of female students at an Australian girls'
boarding school who vanish at Hanging
Rock while on a Valentine's Day picnic,
and the effects the disappearances have
on the school and local community.Picnic
a t  H a n g i n g  R o c k  ( n o v e l )  -
WikipediaPicnic at Hanging Rock (novel),
a 1967 novel by Joan Lindsay Picnic at
Hanging  Rock  (film),  a  1975  film
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adaptation  of  the  novel,  directed  by
Peter  Weir  Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock,  a
2016 theatre adaptation by Tom Wright
(Australian playwright) Picnic at Hanging
Rock  (TV  series),  a  2018  television
adaptationPicnic  at  Hanging  Rock  -
WikipediaPicnic  At  Hanging  Rock  has
long  been  shrouded  in  mystery.  Set
around  a  group  of  private  schoolgirls
who go missing in 1900, the original film
and  the  novel  it's  based  off  have
captivated audiences around the world
for  decades.The  True  Story  Behind
‘Picnic At Hanging Rock’ | ELLE ...Years
ago  I  bought  the  original  Criterion
Collection  DVD  edition  of  "Picnic  at
Hanging Rock". The back of the DVD box
claims  the  movie  is  in  widescreen
format,  but  it  is  not.  It  is  letterboxed;
widescreen in a 4:3 format.Amazon.com:
Picnic at Hanging Rock (Blu-ray + DVD):
Rachel  ...PICNIC  AT  HANGING ROCK is
also  a  particularly  egalitarian  book,  in
which servants may not quite be treated
as  equals  by  their  employers,  but  are
certainly  treated  well.  The  story  itself
often  privileges  the  wits,  talents,  and
pragmatism of  the  servants  over  their
masters'. The atmospheric impact of this
book cannot be overstated.Amazon.com:
Picnic at Hanging Rock (Bolinda Classics
...Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  is  a  1975
Australian mystery film directed by Peter
Weir,  adapted  from  the  novel  of  the
same name. It premiered at the Hindley
Cinema  Complex  in  Adelaide,  South
Australia  on...Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock
TrailerA  lyrical,  meditative  film  charged
with  suppressed  longings,  Picnic  at
Hanging Rock is at long last available in
a pristine widescreen director's cut with
a  newly-minted  Dolby®  digital  5.1
c h a n n e l  s o u n d t r a c k .
Amazon.comAmazon.com:  Picnic  at
Hanging Rock (The Criterion ...Based on
the  acclaimed  1967  novel  by  Joan

Lindsay, PICNIC AT HANGING ROCK is a
stirring chronicle of the disappearance of
an intimate group of women from an all-
female college during a St.  Valentine's
Day  outing  and  the  event's  lingering
aftermath.Picnic at Hanging Rock (1975)
- Plot Summary - IMDbFor me, "Picnic at
Hanging  Rock"  evokes  E.M.  Forster's
novel A Passage to India, made into a
film by David Lean in 1984. In that story,
a  party  of  British  visitors  tours  the
Marabar Caves, which have the peculiar
property  of  turning  all  speech  into  a
meaningless  echo.Picnic  at  Hanging
Rock  movie  review  (1975)  |  Roger
EbertThe  latest  Tweets  from  Picnic  at
Hanging  Rock  (@hangingrocktv).
Viewers  wil l  be  plunged  into  the
mysterious  disappearances  of  3
schoolg i r ls  and  one  teacher  on
Valentine’s  Day 1900Picnic  at  Hanging
Rock (@hangingrocktv) | TwitterHanging
Rock was the inspiration and setting for
the novel Picnic at Hanging Rock, written
by Joan Lindsay and published in 1967.
The novel dealt with the disappearance
of a number of schoolgirls during a visit
to  the  site.Hanging  Rock,  Victoria  -
WikipediaBut  six  years  later,  on
Valentine's  Day,  1900,  the  enigmatic
headmistress allows her pupils to picnic
at  Hanging  Rock.  And  there,  in  the
strange brooding landscape, something
unthinkable happens.
For me, "Picnic at Hanging Rock" evokes
E.M. Forster's novel A Passage to India,
made into a film by David Lean in 1984.
In that story, a party of British visitors
tours the Marabar Caves, which have the
peculiar  property of  turning all  speech
into a meaningless echo.
Picnic at Hanging Rock (film) - Wikipedia
Hanging  Rock  was  the  inspiration  and
setting for the novel Picnic at Hanging
Rock,  written  by  Joan  Lindsay  and
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published in 1967. The novel dealt with
the  disappearance  of  a  number  of
schoolgirls  during  a  visit  to  the  site.
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (TV  Mini-
Series 2018) - IMDb
PICNIC  AT  HANGING  ROCK  is  also  a
particularly  egalitarian  book,  in  which
servants  may  not  quite  be  treated  as
equals  by  their  employers,  but  are
certainly  treated  well.  The  story  itself
often  privileges  the  wits,  talents,  and
pragmatism of  the  servants  over  their
masters'. The atmospheric impact of this
book cannot be overstated.
Watch Picnic at Hanging Rock - Season 1
| Prime Video
Memorable  Reboots  and  Remakes  Get
ready  for  "  Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  "
starring Natalie Dormer with a look back
at  some classic  movies  and TV shows
that  have  been  rebooted  and  remade
over  the  years.  Won  1  BAFTA  Film
A w a r d .  A n o t h e r  3  w i n s  &  1 1
nominations.
Picnic at Hanging Rock (TV series) -
Wikipedia
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  is  a  1975
Australian mystery film directed by Peter
Weir,  adapted  from  the  novel  of  the
same name. It premiered at the Hindley
Cinema  Complex  in  Adelaide,  South
Australia  on...
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  movie
review  (1975)  |  Roger  Ebert
A  lyrical,  meditative  film  charged  with
suppressed longings, Picnic at Hanging
Rock is at long last available in a pristine
widescreen director's cut with a newly-
minted  Dolby®  digital  5.1  channel
soundtrack.  Amazon.com

THE POWER OF NARRATION

At the heart  of  every good fiction Picnic

At  Hanging  Rock  publication  is  an
engaging story. As visitors, we're drawn
to personalities who face difficulties, get
rid  of  barriers,  and  inevitably,  arise
triumphant.  We come to be purchased
their lives and in the world created by
the  writer.  The  best  fiction  publications
transport  us  to  different  times  and
locations,  and  make  us  really  feel  a
range  of  emotions,  from  love  and
happiness  to  sadness  and  fear.

THE SIGNIFICANCE OF FICTION
EVALUATIONS OF PICNIC AT HANGING
ROCK

Reviews play a crucial  function on the
planet  of  fiction  publications.  They  aid
visitors choose which Picnic At Hanging
Rock books to review next and provide
beneficial  responses  to  writers.  In
addition,  reviews  can  affect  publication
sales  and  impact  the  success  of  both
established  and  upcoming  writers.  By
sharing your thoughts and opinions in a
testimonial,  you  can  aid  various  other
visitors  find  their  following  preferred
book and add to the literary community.

COMPOSING A FICTION EVALUATION
OF PICNIC AT HANGING ROCK

When composing a fiction book review, it
is  necessary  to  consider  the  overall
framework of your testimonial. Start with
a  sho r t  r ecap  o f  the  s to ry  and
characters, then look into your ideas and
viewpoints. Make sure to concentrate on
particular  components  of  guide  that
stood apart to you, such as the writing
design,  personality  advancement,  or
story  twists.  And  do  not  be  afraid  to
share your individual connection to the
Picnic At Hanging Rock publication and
how it made you really feel.
Bear in mind, your viewpoint matters on
the  planet  of  fiction  books.  By  sharing
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your ideas through a review, you can aid
various  other  viewers  find  the  magic  of
narration  and  get  in  touch  with  the
incredible literary community that exists
around the globe.

NON-FICTION REVIEWS
Non-fiction literary works offers a wealth
of understanding and details on various
topics. From bios to background, science
to national politics, non-fiction books can
widen your viewpoint and expand your
understanding of the world around you.
P i c n i c  A t  H a n g i n g  R o c k  B o o k
testimonials  are  specifically  essential
when  it  concerns  non-fiction  literature.
They can provide useful understandings
right  into  the  accuracy,  dependability,
and  total  high  quality  of  the  info
provided  in  a  publication.  Evaluations
can likewise aid you figure out if  a book
is  appropr ia te  fo r  you  and  i f  i t
straightens  with  your  interests  and
viewpoints.
When  checking  out  non-fiction
evaluations,  be  sure  to  consider  the
customer's  qualifications  and  expertise
on the topic. Try to find testimonials that
offer  certain  examples  and  evidence  to
support  their  insurance  claims.  It's
additionally  a  great  concept  to  read
evaluations  from multiple  resources  to
get  an  all-around  understanding  of  a
publication.

THE POWER OF NON-FICTION REVIEWS

Non-fiction  evaluations  can  have  a
considerable  effect  on  both  the  writer
and  the  visitor.  Positive  reviews  can
increase a book's exposure and integrity,
bring about greater sales and a broader
audience.  Unfavorable  evaluations,  on
the  various  other  hand,  can  give
constructive criticism for the author to
enhance their writing and study.

As a reader, your reviews can likewise
make a distinction. Your responses can
assist  various  other  viewers  determine
whether to check out Picnic At Hanging
Rock,  and  it  can  also  offer  valuable
understandings for the writer to take into
consideration in future jobs.
So,  whether  you're  a  background
aficionado or a self-help enthusiast, non-
fiction  evaluations  can  help  you  find
brand-new  books  and  broaden  your
expertise.  Welcome the power of book
evaluations and allow them direct you on
your literary trip.

WRITING PICNIC AT
HANGING ROCK BOOK
REVIEW
If you're a publication lover, chances are
you  have  actually  composed  a  book
evaluation prior to. Nonetheless, writing
a book evaluation that is informative and
appealing can be a daunting task. Right
here are some suggestions to aid you
craft a well-written evaluation:

STRUCTURE YOUR EVALUATION

Beginning with a quick intro that consists
of the author's name, the title of guide,
and the style. After that, give a recap of
the  plot  without  giving  away  any
spoilers.  General ly  body  of  your
testimonial,  discuss the toughness and
weak points of Picnic At Hanging Rock.
Lastly, end with your general viewpoint
and suggestion.

EXPRESS YOUR IDEAS AND
VIEWPOINTS

Do not be afraid to share your ideas and
opinions.  Let  your  viewers  understand
what you liked and didn't like regarding
the  book.  Be  specific  and  supply
examples to back up your opinions. This
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adds integrity to your Picnic At Hanging
Rock  rev i ew  and  a ids  r eade r s
understand  your  point  of  view.

STAY CLEAR OF PICNIC AT HANGING
ROCK LOOTERS

One  of  the  most  vital  guidelines  of
creating a publication testimonial  is  to
prevent  looters.  Don't  give  away
significant  plot  points  or  the  ending  of
guide.  It  is  necessary  to  let  visitors
discover the tale for themselves.

BE HONEST AND POSITIVE

As a reviewer, your job is to offer honest
comments  to  the  author  and  possible
readers. Be useful in your objection and
provide ideas for enhancement. Keep in
mind to be respectful and stay clear of
personal strikes.
By adhering to these pointers, you'll be
well  on  your  means  to  composing
effective  Picnic  At  Hanging  Rock  book
reviews that will  certainly educate and
involve your audience.
Picnic at Hanging Rock (1975) - Rotten
Tomatoes
Based on the acclaimed 1967 novel by
Joan Lindsay, PICNIC AT HANGING ROCK
i s  a  s t i r r i n g  c h r o n i c l e  o f  t h e
disappearance of  an intimate group of
women from an all-female college during
a  St.  Valentine's  Day  outing  and  the
event's lingering aftermath.
Amazon.com:  Picnic  at  Hanging
Rock  (Bolinda  Classics  ...
The latest Tweets from Picnic at Hanging
Rock (@hangingrocktv). Viewers will be
p l u n g e d  i n t o  t h e  m y s t e r i o u s
disappearances of 3 schoolgirls and one
teacher on Valentine’s Day 1900
Picnic At Hanging Rock
Picnic at Hanging Rock is an Australian

mystery  romantic  drama  television
series  that  premiered  on  Foxtel  's
Showcase  on  6  May  2018.  The  series
was adapted from Joan Lindsay 's 1967
novel of the same name about a group
of schoolgirls who, while on an outing to
Hanging Rock, mysteriously disappear.
The  True  Story  Behind  ‘Picnic  At
Hanging Rock’ | ELLE ...
Peter  Weir's  beautiful  1975  mystery
"Picnic at  Hanging Rock" is  a majestic
tour-de-force  like  nothing  else  Weir
would ever make in the future. At the
center of the story is the strange ...
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (1975)  -
IMDb
But six years later, on Valentine's Day,
1900, the enigmatic headmistress allows
her pupils to picnic at Hanging Rock. And
there ,  in  the  s t range  brood ing
landscape,  something  unthinkable
happens.
Amazon.com:  Picnic  at  Hanging
Rock  (Blu-ray  +  DVD):  Rachel  ...
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  will  plunge
v i e w e r s  i n t o  t h e  m y s t e r i o u s
disappearances of three schoolgirls and
one  teacher  on  Valentine's  Day  1900,
taking the audience on a new journey
into the revered Australian novel.

RESERVE REVIEW
COMMUNITIES
If you're a follower of Picnic At Hanging
Rock publication and love to share your
thoughts and opinions, signing up with
book  review  areas  is  a  must.  These
communities are a wonderful way to get
in  touch  with  like-minded  people,
uncover  brand-new  publications,  and
share your reviews with a broader target
market.
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ONLINE PLATFORMS

Numerous online systems are dedicated
to  publication  testimonials,  such  as
Goodreads,  which  is  one  of  the  most
preferred  systems.  Goodreads  allows
you  to  price  and  review  publications,
connect with other visitors, and sign up
with teams to review publications.
An  additional  prominent  platform  is
Amazon, which not just enables you to
buy  books  however  also  provides  an
area  for  visitors  to  leave  evaluations.
This means you can not just see what
others consider Picnic At Hanging Rock
book,  but you can likewise share your
own  opinions  and  help  others  make
notified choices.

BOOK CLUBS

Signing up with a book club is a fantastic
method  to  expand  your  reading
perspectives  and  connect  with  various
other publication fans. Many book clubs
have  on-line  neighborhoods  where
members  can  discuss  books,  leave
reviews,  and  share  recommendations.
There  are  likewise  many  Picnic  At
Hanging Rock book clubs that meet in
person, which allows you to connect with
individuals  in  your  area  and  review
books in person. Get in touch with your
library  or  bookstore  for  book  clubs  in
your location.
On  the  whole,  publication  evaluation
neighborhoods  provide  a  terrific  way  to
improve  your  analysis  experience  and
connect  with  others.  So,  if  you're
passionate concerning Picnic At Hanging
Rock,  don't  be  reluctant  to  join  these
neighborhoods and share your love for
literature!

VERDICT: WELCOME THE

MAGIC OF PICNIC AT
HANGING ROCK BOOK
REVIEWS
To  conclude,  we  wish  this  post  has
actually  highlighted  the  relevance  of
publication testimonials and exactly how
they  can  assist  you  find  your  next
favorite read. From fiction to non-fiction,
evaluations  give  useful  feedback  to
writers and overview visitors in choosing
the  appropriate  publications  based  on
their rate of interests.
But  it's  not  almost  locating  the  best
Picnic At Hanging Rock book - reviews
develop areas where publication lovers
can connect and share their ideas and
point of views. Joining book testimonial
communities  can  boost  your  reading
experience and open your mind to new
viewpoints.
So,  we  motivate  you  to  welcome  the
magic of Picnic At Hanging Rock reviews.
Whether you're a skilled viewers or just
s tar t ing  your  l i terary  journey,
evaluations  are  an  effective  device  on
the  planet  of  literature.  Your  point  of
view matters, and by sharing your ideas,
you  can  aid  shape  the  conversation
around books.
We  hope  this  write-up  has  actually
inspired  you  to  check  out  Picnic  At
Hanging  Rock,  connect  with  fellow
vis i tors,  and  compose  your  own
testimonials.  Pleased  reading!
Picnic at Hanging Rock (1975) - Plot
Summary - IMDb
Picnic at Hanging Rock is an Australian
historical  fiction  novel  by  Joan  Lindsay.
Set in 1900, it is about a group of female
students at an Australian girls' boarding
school who vanish at Hanging Rock while
on  a  Valentine's  Day  picnic,  and  the
effects  the  disappearances  have  on  the
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school and local community.
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (novel)  -
Wikipedia
Set in 1900, Picnic at Hanging Rock tells
the  story  of  three  Australian  boarding
school girls who inexplicably vanish on a
field  trip  to  a  remote  and  historic
landmark, the Hanging Rock. While the...
Picnic at Hanging Rock (@hangingrocktv)
| Twitter
Picnic at Hanging Rock (novel), a 1967
novel by Joan Lindsay Picnic at Hanging
Rock (film), a 1975 film adaptation of the
novel,  directed by Peter Weir Picnic at
Hanging Rock, a 2016 theatre adaptation
by  Tom  Wright  (Australian  playwright)
Picnic  at  Hanging  Rock  (TV  series),  a
2018 television adaptation
Hanging Rock, Victoria - Wikipedia
Picnic At Hanging Rock
The  end  of  Amazon's  'Picnic  at
Hanging Rock' explained
Years ago I bought the original Criterion
Collection  DVD  edition  of  "Picnic  at
Hanging Rock". The back of the DVD box
claims  the  movie  is  in  widescreen
format,  but  it  is  not.  It  is  letterboxed;
widescreen in a 4:3 format.
Picnic at Hanging Rock Trailer
Picnic  At  Hanging Rock has long been
shrouded in mystery. Set around a group
of private schoolgirls who go missing in
1900, the original film and the novel it's
based  off  have  captivated  audiences
around  the  world  for  decades.

REVIEW OF PICNIC AT
HANGING ROCK
• Here he is again, that commander of
luminous prose William Trevor. With this,
his  13th  novel,  the  master  has  some

surprises  in  store  as  his  unparalleled
accounting  weaves  a  psychological
thriller.Felicia,  whose  appearance  is
deemed "nun like" is the only daughter
of an impoverished Irish gardener. She
leaves  the  home  where  she  cooks,
c leans  and  tends  to  an  e lder ly
grandmother  to  find  the  boy  she  loves,
Johnny. Knowing only that he works in a
lawn mower factory somewhere in the
English  Midlands,  she  embarks  on  her
fateful  journey.Unable  to  locate  the
factory,  let  alone  Johnny,  she  is
befriended  by  Mr.  Hilditch,  a  portly
catering  manager  with  a  penchant  for
pop  tunes  from  the  50s,  a  portrait
gallery of strangers decorating his walls,
and a black past. Mr. Hilditch follows her,
assures  her  dependence  upon  him by
stealing  her  money,  and  eventually
takes her into his home.Trevor's brilliant
narrative  skills  are  showcased  as  he
weaves  the  story  with  flashbacks,
revelations of  his  characters'  thoughts,
and displays of their dreams. As always,
he  is  articulate  and  compassionate,
bringing  his  shuddery  thriller  to  the
zenith of a conclusion.
• There's a strong Hitchcock feel to this
novel, as well as "Beauty and the Beast".
One  can't  help  but  be  impressed  by
William Trevor's delicate handling of his
characters,  and  his  superb  build-up  of
suspense. Weaving them together, and
constantly holding back information, he
depicts a depth portrait of humanity that
is  at  once  devastating  and  real.  He
questions  whether  evil  people  are
intrinsically  that  way,  or  whether  they
are  shaped  by  consequence,  and
emotion. William Trevor is a master in
his  prose,  and  the  brilliance  of  the
tension never ceases to revolve around
the novel.


